Agenda ltem # 4.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LOS ALTOS
AMENDING TITLE 12 OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE BY REPLACING
CHAPTERS 12.04, 12.08, 12.10, 12.12, 12.16, 12.20, 12.22, 12.24, 12.26, 12.30, 12.32, 12.42
AND 12.68 TO ADOPT BY REFERENCE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS THE
FOLLOWING:

2022 CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

2022 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

2022 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

2022 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL
ASSOCIATION OF PLUMBING AND MECHANICAL OFFICIALS;

2022 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL ASSOCIATION OF PLUMBING AND MECHANICAL
OFFICIALS;

2022 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, PUBLISHED BY
THE NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION AGENCY;

2022 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE, PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

2022 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

2022 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE, PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

2022 CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

AND 2022 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE, PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN ADMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS,
DELETIONS AND CHANGES THERETO.

Ordinance No. 2022- 1

ATTACHMENT 1

55




Agenda ltem # 4.

Chapter 12.22 ENERGY CODE
12.22.010 Adoption of the California Energy Code.

There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set forth herein, the 2019 California Energy
Code, contained in the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 6, published by the
International Code Council, and each and all of its regulations and provisions. One copy is on
file for use and examination by the public in the office of the building official.

12.22.020 Amendments for all-electric buildings.

City of Los Altos local amendments to the 2022 California Energy Code. Upon adoption of
this Code in the event that there is any conflict between local amendments and the 2022
California Energy Code the most restrictive shall prevail.

A. Amend Section 100.1(b) of the Energy Code by adding the following definitions to
read as follows:

ALL-ELECTRIC BUILDING is a building that has no natural gas or propane
plumbing installed within the building.

NEWLY CONSTRUCTED BUILDING (Applicable to Chapter 12.22 Energy Code
Section 12.22.020 Amendments) is a building that has never been used or occupied
for any purpose and supported by 1) a new structural foundation, 2) an existing,
structural foundation where a building has been demolished and removed to floor or
below, or 3) a combination of 1) and 2).

PUBLIC BUILDING is a building used by the public for any purpose, such as
assembly, education, entertainment, or worship.

SCIENTIFIC LABORATORY BUILDING is a building or area where research,
experiments, and measurement in medical, life, and physical sciences are performed
and/or stored requiring examination of fine details. The building may include
workbenches, countertops, scientific instruments, and supporting offices.

Subchapter 1 Section 100.0(e)2.A. is deleted and replaced to read as follows, based on
express finding of necessity set forth of this Ordinance.

B. Amend Section 100.0(e)2.A. of the Energy Code to read as follows:
2. Newly constructed buildings.
A. Sections 110.0 through 110.12 apply to all newly constructed buildings within the
scope of Section 100.0(a). In addition, newly constructed buildings shall meet the

requirements of Subsections B, C, D or E, as applicable and shall be an all-electric
building as defined in Section 100.1(b).

Ordinance No. 2022- 17

ATTACHMENT 1

71




Agenda ltem # 4.

Exception 1: Residential Single-Family Dwellings, Detached ADUs (Accessory
Dwelling Units), Multifamily Dwellings with two to nine units may install non-electric
(natural gas-fueled) cooking and fireplace appliances if the applicant complies with the
prewiring provisions, Subsection 12.22.020B.3.

Exception 2: Non-residential Buildings containing for-profit restaurant open to the

public may

install gas-fueled cooking appliances. The applicant shall comply with the

pre-wiring provision of Subsection 12.22.020B.3.

Exception 3: Non-residential buildings, Scientific Laboratory Buildings and Public
Buildings may apply to the Building Division of the Los Altos Development Services
Department for an exception to install a non-electric fueled appliance or piece of

equipment.

The Building Division of the Los Altos Development Services

Department shall grant an exception if they find the following conditions are met:

L.

il.

The applicant shows that there is a public or business-related need that
cannot be reasonably met with an electric fueled appliance or piece of
equipment.

The applicant complies with the pre-wiring provisions to the non-

electric appliance or piece of equipment noted at Subsection
12.22.020B.3.

The decision of the Building Division of the Los Altos Development Services
Department shall be final unless the applicant appeals the decision to the City Manager
or his or her designee within 15 days of the date of the decision. The City Managet's
or his or her designee's decision on the appeal shall be final.

3. Wiring to accommodate future electric appliances or equipment.

(a) If a non-electric appliance or piece of equipment is allowed to be installed, the
appliance or equipment location must also be electrically pre-wired for future electric
appliance or equipment installation, including:

1.

1.

1.

1v.

A dedicated circuit, phased appropriately, with a minimum amperage
requirement for a comparable electric appliance with an electrical
receptacle or junction box that is connected to the electric panel with
conductors of adequate capacity, extending to within 3 feet of the
appliance and accessible with no obstructions. Appropriately sized conduit
may be installed in lieu of conductors; and

Both ends of the unused conductor or conduit shall be labeled with the
words "For Future Electric appliance or equipment” and be electrically
isolated; and

A reserved circuit breaker space shall be installed in the electrical panel
adjacent to the circuit breaker for the branch circuit and labeled for each
circuit, an example is as follows (i.e. "For Future Electric Range;"); and
All electrical components, including conductors, receptacles, junction
boxes, or blank covers, related to this section shall be installed in
accordance with the California Electrical Code.

Ordinance No. 2022- 18

ATTACHMENT 1 72




Agenda ltem # 4.

SECTION 19. AUTHORITY AND FINDINGS.

The following findings support that the above amendments and modifications are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions:

The City of Los Altos is located in Climate Zone 4 as established in the 2019 California
Energy Code. Climate Zone 4 includes Santa Clara County, San Benito County, portions of
Monterey County and San Luis Obispo. The City experiences an average of 19 inches of
precipitation per year. In Los Altos, January is the rainiest month of the year while July is
the driest month of the year. Temperatures average about 80 degrees Fahrenheit in the
summer and about 40 degrees Fahrenheit in the winter. These climatic conditions along
with the effects of climate change caused by Green House Gas (GHG) emissions generated
from burning natural gas to heat buildings and emissions from Vehicle Miles Traveled results
in an overall increase in global average temperature. Higher global temperatures are
contributing to rising sea levels, record heat waves, droughts, wildfires, and floods.

The above local amendments to the 2022 California Energy Code are necessary to combat
the ever-increasing harmful effects of global climate change. Implementation of the
proposed code amendments will achieve decarbonization and provide an accelerated path
to reduce GHG emissions. The proposed Ordinance containing these amendments would
ensure that new buildings use cleaner sources of energy which helps meet the goal of cutting
carbon emissions in half by 2030.

All-electric building design benefits the health, welfare, and resiliency of Los Altos and
its residents.

SECTION 20. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.24 of the Municipal
Code is hereby repealed.

SECTION 21. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.24 of the Municipal Code
is hereby added to read as follows:

Chapter 12.24 FIRE CODE

Section 12.24.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Fire Code

Section 12.24.015 Findings.

Section 12.24.020 Establishment and duties of the fire prevention division.
Section 12.24.030 Definitions.

Section 12.24.080 Firte Code Amendments.

Section 12.24.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Fire Code

There is hereby adopted by the City, for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing
conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or explosion, that certain code known as the
2022 California Fire Code, contained in the 2022 California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part
9, which incorporates and amends the International Fire Code 2021Edition, published by the
International Code Council, including Appendix Chapters B, C, D and O, save and except such
portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended by this chapter. One copy has been filed

Ordinance No. 2022- 19

ATTACHMENT 1 73




Agenda ltem # 4.

Section D103.1 is deleted:

D103.1 Access Road width with a hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a fire apparatus
access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of shoulders
(see Figure D103.1).

Section D103.2 is amended as follows:

D103.2 Grade. The maximum grade of a fire department apparatus access road shall not exceed
15-percent, unless approved by the fire code official.

Section D103.3 is amended as follows:

D103.3 Turning radius. The required turning radius of a fire apparatus access roads shall be a
minimum of 30 feet inside, and a minimum of 50 feet outside.

Section D103.4 is amended as follows:

D103.4 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and/or driveways in excess of 150 feet
(45 720 mm) shall be provided with width and turnaround provisions in accordance with Table
D103.4 the Santa Clara County Fire Department apparatus access and turnaround standards, as
approved by the fire code official.

Section D103.6 is amended as follows:

D103.6 Signs. Where required by the Fire Code Official, fire apparatus access roads shall be
designated and marked as a fire lane as set forth in Section 22500.1 of the California Vehicle
Code and the Santa Clara County Fire Department A-6 Standard. Signs shall have a minimum
dimension of 12 inches (305 mm) wide by 18 inches (457 mm) high and have red letters on a

white reflective background. Signs shall be posted on one or both sides of the fire apparatus road
as required by Section D103.6.1 or D103.6.2.

SECTION 22. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.26 of the Municipal
Code is hereby repealed.

SECTION 23. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.26 of the Municipal
Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Chapter 12.26 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
City of Los Altos local amendments to the 2022 California Green Building Standards Code.
Upon adoption of this Code in the event that there is any conflict between local amendments

and the 2022 California Green Building Standards Code the most restrictive shall prevail.

Section 12.26.010 Adoption of the California Green Building Standards Code
Section 12.26.020 Amendments, Additions or Deletions

Ordinance No. 2022- 54

ATTACHMENT 1

108



https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/CAFC2022P1/appendix-d-fire-apparatus-access-roads#CAFC2022P1_Pt07_AppxD_SecD103.1_FigD103.1

Agenda ltem # 4.

Section 12.26.010 Adoption of the California Green Building Standards Code

There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set forth herein, the 2022 California Green
Building Standards Code, contained in the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 11,
published by the International Code Council, and each and all of its regulations and provisions.
One copy is on file for use and examination by the public in the office of the Building Official.

Section 12.26.020 Amendments, Additions or Deletions

The 2022 California Green Building Standards Code referred to in Section 12.26.010 is
adopted, together with Chapters 1 Administration, 4 Residential Mandatory Measures, and 5
Nonresidential Mandatory Measures, of the 2022 California Green Building Standards Code,
with the following amendments as follows:

Chapter 1 Section 102.4 Scope and Mandatory Compliance is hereby added to read as follows.
Section 102.4 Scope and Mandatory Compliance

A. This code contains both mandatory and voluntary green building measures. Mandatory
and voluntary measures are identified in the appropriate chapters contained in this code.
Compliance measures and methods shall be by one of the following measures approved
by the Building Official.

The means by which compliance measures are achieved shall be mandatory measures with
appendix sections voluntarily applied, building division mandatory check list, whole house
Build it Green GreenPoint check list, LEED, other recognized point systems, Title 24 Part
6 Energy Efficiency Standards, or equivalent approved methods. Green Building
Compliance measures in addition to checklists shall be incorporated into the project
drawings approved by the Building Official prior to building permit submittal.

Prior to issuance of a building permit, the owner or responsible Registered Design
Professional acting as the ownet’s agent shall employ and/or retain a Qualified Green
Building Professional to the satisfaction of the Building Official, and prior to final
inspection shall submit verification that the project is in compliance with this ordinance.

Chapter 4 Section 4.106.4.1 Electric vehicle (EV) charging for new construction thru
4.106.4.2.2 are deleted and replaced to read as follows, based upon express findings set forth

in this Ordinance.

Section 4.106.4.1 and 4.106.4.2.1 and 4.106.4.2.2 are amended to read as follows:

4.106.4.1 New one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses with attached private

garages.

For each dwelling unit, install at least one Level 2 EV Ready Space in the garage. If multiple (two
or more) garage parking spaces are provided for a dwelling unit, install at least two Level 2 EV

Ready Spaces.

Ordinance No. 2022- 55

ATTACHMENT 1

109




Agenda ltem # 4.

4.106.4.2.1 Multifamily development projects with less than 20 dwelling units; and hotels
and motels with less than 20 sleeping units or guest rooms. The number of dwelling units,
sleeping units or guest rooms shall be based on all buildings on a project site subject to this
section.

1. EV Capable. Twenty-five (25) percent of the total number of parking spaces on a
building site, provided for all types of parking facilities, shall be electric vehicle charging
spaces (EV spaces) capable of supporting future Level 2 EVSE. Electrical load
calculations shall demonstrate that the electrical panel service capacity and electrical
system, including any on-site distribution transformer(s), have sufficient capacity to
simultaneously charge all EVs at all required EV spaces at a minimum of 40 amperes.

The service panel or subpanel circuit directory shall identify the overcurrent protective
device space(s) reserved for future EV charging purposes as “EV CAPABLE” in
accordance with the California Energy Code.

Exceptions:

1. When EV chargers (Level 2 EVSE) are installed in a number equal to or greater than
the required number of EV capable spaces.

2. When EV chargers (Level 2 EVSE) are installed in a number less than the required
number of EV capable spaces, the number of EV capable spaces required may be
reduced by a number equal to the number of EV chargers installed.

The following requirements apply to all multifamily development projects with less than 20
dwelling units; and hotels and motels with less than 20 sleeping units or guest rooms:
1. Calculations for the required minimum number of Level 2 EVSE spaces shall be
rounded up to the nearest whole number.
2. Inaddition, each remaining dwelling unit with parking space(s) shall be provided with
at least one Level 2 EV Ready Space.

4.106.4.2.2 Multifamily development projects with 20 or more dwelling units; and hotels
and motels with 20 or more sleeping units or guest rooms. The number of dwelling units,
sleeping units or guest rooms shall be based on all buildings on a project site subject to this
section.

2. EV Capable. Twenty-five (25) percent of the total number of parking spaces on a
building site, provided for all types of parking facilities, shall be electric vehicle charging
spaces (EV spaces) capable of supporting future Level 2 EVSE. Electrical load
calculations shall demonstrate that the electrical panel service capacity and electrical
system, including any on-site distribution transformer(s), have sufficient capacity to
simultaneously charge all EVs at all required EV spaces at a minimum of 40 amperes.

The service panel or subpanel circuit directory shall identify the overcurrent protective
device space(s) reserved for future EV charging purposes as “EV CAPABLE” in
accordance with the California Energy Code.

Exceptions:
3. When EV chargers (Level 2 EVSE) are installed in a number equal to or greater than

Ordinance No. 2022- 56

ATTACHMENT 1 110




Agenda ltem # 4.

the required number of EV capable spaces.

4. When EV chargers (Level 2 EVSE) are installed in a number less than the required
number of EV capable spaces, the number of EV capable spaces required may be
reduced by a number equal to the number of EV chargers installed.

The following requirements apply to all multifamily development projects with 20 or more
dwelling units; and hotels and motels with 20 or more sleeping units or guest rooms:
3. Calculations for the required minimum number of Level 2 EVSE spaces shall be
rounded up to the nearest whole number.
4. Inaddition, each remaining dwelling unit with parking space(s) shall be provided with
at least one Level 2 EV Ready Space.

Chapter 5 Section 5.106.5.3 Electric vehicle (EV) charging thru 5.106.5.3.5 are deleted and
replaced to read as follows, based upon express findings set forth in this Ordinance

Section 5.106.5.3 thru 5.106.5.3.5 are amended to read as follows:

5.106.5.3 Electric vehicle (EV) charging. [N] New construction to provide electric vehicle
infrastructure and facilitate electric vehicle charging shall comply with Section 5.106.5.3.1 and
shall be provided in accordance with regulations in the California building Code and the
California Electrical Code.

Exceptions:
1. Where there is no local utility power supply.
2. Parking spaces accessible only by automated mechanical car parking systems are not
required to comply with this code section.

5.106.5.3.1 Office and Institutional buildings. In nonresidential new construction buildings
designated primarily for office use and institutional buildings, with parking:
1. When 10 or more parking spaces are constructed, 50% of the available parking spaces on
site shall be equipped with Level 2 EVSE;
2. An additional 20% shall be provided with at least Level 1 EV Ready Spaces; and
3. An additional 30% shall be at least Level 2 EV Capable.

Calculations for the required minimum number of spaces equipped with Level 2 EVSE, Level 1
EV Ready spaces and EV Capable spaces shall all be rounded up to the nearest whole number.

Construction plans and specifications shall demonstrate that all raceways shall be a minimum of
1”7 and sufficient for installation of EVSE at all required Level 1 EV Ready and EV Capable
spaces; Electrical calculations shall substantiate the design of the electrical system to include the
rating of equipment and any on-site distribution transformers, and have sufficient capacity to
simultaneously charge EVs at all required EV spaces including Level 1 EV Ready and EV Capable
spaces; and service panel or subpanel(s) shall have sufficient capacity to accommodate the
required number of dedicated branch circuit(s) for the future installation of the EVSE.

5.106.5.3.2 Other nonresidential buildings. In nonresidential new construction buildings that
are not designated primarily for office use, such as those for retail uses:

Ordinance No. 2022- 57

ATTACHMENT 1

111




Agenda ltem # 4.

1. When 10 or more parking spaces are constructed, 6% of the available parking spaces on
site shall be equipped with Level 2 EVSE;
2. An additional 5% shall be at least L.evel 1 EV Ready.

Calculations for the required minimum number of spaces equipped with Level 2 EVSE and Level
1 EV Ready spaces shall be rounded up to the nearest whole number

SECTION 24. AUTHORITY AND FINDINGS.

The following findings support that the above amendments and modifications are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions:

The City of Los Altos is located in Climate Zone 4 as established in the 2019 California
Energy Code. Climate Zone 4 includes Santa Clara County, San Benito County, portions of
Monterey County and San Luis Obispo. The City experiences an average of 19 inches of
precipitation per year. In Los Altos, January is the rainiest month of the year while July is
the driest month of the year. Temperatures average about 80 degrees Fahrenheit in the
summer and about 40 degrees Fahrenheit in the winter. These climatic conditions along
with the effects of climate change caused by Green House Gas (GHG) emissions generated
from burning natural gas to heat buildings and emissions from Vehicle Miles Traveled results
in an overall increase in global average temperature. Higher global temperatures are
contributing to rising sea levels, record heat waves, droughts, wildfires, and floods.

The above local amendments to the 2022 California Green Building Standards Code are
necessary to combat the ever-increasing harmful effects of global climate
change. Implementation of the proposed code amendments will achieve decarbonization
and provide an accelerated path to reduce GHG emissions. The proposed Ordinance
containing these amendments would ensure that new buildings use cleaner sources of energy
which helps meet the goal of cutting carbon emissions in half by 2030.

Increased Electric Vehicle Infrastructure integrated into building design benefits the health,
welfare, and resiliency of Los Altos and its residents.

SECTION 25. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.30 of the Municipal
Code is hereby repealed.

SECTION 26. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.30 of the Municipal
Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Chapter 12.30 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE
Section 12.30.10 Adoption of the California Existing Building Code.

There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set forth herein, the 2022 California Existing
Building Code, contained in the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 10, and also the
International Existing Building Code 2021 Edition, published by the International Code
Council, and each and all of its regulations and provisions. One copy is on file for use and
examination by the public in the office of the Building Official.

Ordinance No. 2022- 58

ATTACHMENT 1 112




Agenda ltem # 4.

SECTION 27. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.32 of the Municipal
Code is hereby repealed.

SECTION 28. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.32 of the Municipal
Code is hereby replaced to read as follows:

Chapter 12:32 CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE
Section 12.32.10 Adoption of the California Historical Building Code.

There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set forth herein, the 2022 California Historical
Building Code, contained in the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 8, published by
the International Code Council, is hereby adopted. There is one copy of said code on file in
the office of the Building Official for use and examination by the public.

SECTION 29. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.42 of the Municipal
Code is hereby repealed.

SECTION 30. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.42 of the Municipal
Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Chapter 12.42 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE
Section 12.42.10 Adoption of the California Referenced Standards Code.

There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set forth herein, the 2022 California Referenced
Standards Code, contained in the 2022 edition of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24,
Part 12, published by the International Code Council, and each and all of its regulations and
provisions. One copy is on file for use and examination by the public in the office of the
Building Official.

SECTION 31. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.68 of the Municipal Code
is hereby repealed.

SECTION 32. AMENDMENT OF CODE: Title 12, Chapter 12.68 of the Municipal
Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Chapter 12.68 UNDERGROUNDING UTILITIES

Section 12.68.010 Purpose.
Section 12.68.020 Undergrounding utilities.

Section 12.68.010 Purpose.

The purpose of this chapter is to improve and maintain the visual quality and public and
private views in the city, as well as to protect and enhance the health and quality of life of its
citizens, by reducing hazards along with the visual blight created by overhead utilities.

Ordinance No. 2022- 59

ATTACHMENT 1

113




Agenda ltem # 4.

Section 12.68.020 Undergrounding utilities.

It is the intent of the city to ensure that all new utility services and relocated existing utility
services are placed underground, including additions exceeding fifty (50) percent of floor area
and/or seven hundred and fifty (750) square feet or more, excluding basements and any non-
habitable floor areas. For the purpose of this section, removal of roof framing with associated
exterior walls down to, or below the subfloor/slab shall be included in the above calculations.
Therefore, the following shall apply:

a. In areas served by existing overhead facilities, all new service drops shall be installed
underground from the most convenient existing pole.

b. Relocations and extensions of existing overhead facilities shall be prohibited; provided,
however, relocation of existing poles shall be permitted in some instances pursuant to
Section 13.20.160 of this municipal code.

c. Residential properties that are served by utilities located in rear yards on standard lots
with frontage on only one public right-of-way shall not be required to underground
existing overhead services.

d. The obligation to provide compliance with these underground utility regulations may
not be evaded by performing a series of small additions undertaken over a three-year
petiod and/or two code cycles. The original addition permit issuance date where these
regulations were in effect shall be used for compliance.

i.  Any submittal for building permits which exceed fifty (50) percent and/or seven
hundred and fifty (750) square feet of existing floor areas (area calculations shall
not include existing basement floor areas and any non-habitable floor areas i.e.,
garages) during the three-year period shall comply with undergrounding of utility
regulations.

i.  No exception or waiver shall be granted from compliance with undergrounding
utilities.

e. 'The Building Official may only grant exceptions to these requirements in cases where
access across adjacent property is necessary but is not legally or practically available.

1. To demonstrate an exception the property owner shall provide a plan showing
the required utility design, communication with adjacent property owners
indicating the lack of access allowed, and a letter from the utility company
which indicates that no alternative configuration for undergrounding of
utilities is possible.

f.  Completion of Work. Undergrounding utilities shall be completed prior to Building
Final Inspection, and issuance of Certificate of Occupancy. No exception or waiver
shall be granted which allows for a property owner to evade compliance with this
requirement.

SECTION 33. CEQA. The City Council hereby finds and determines that this Ordinance
has been assessed in accordance with the California Environmental Quality Act (Cal. Pub. Res.
Code, § 21000 et seq.) (“CEQA”) and the State CEQA Guidelines (14 Cal. Code Regs. § 15000
et seq.) and is categorically exempt from CEQA under CEQA Guidelines, § 15061(b)(3),
which exempts from CEQA any project where it can be seen with certainty that there is no
possibility that the activity in question may have a significant effect on the environment.
Adoption of the proposed Ordinance would not be an activity with potential to cause
significant adverse effect on the environment because the changes made to the California

Ordinance No. 2022- 60

ATTACHMENT 1

114




Agenda ltem # 4.

Green Buildings Standards Code within are enacted to provide more protection to the
environment, and therefore is exempt from CEQA. It is also exempt from CEQA pursuant
to CEQA Guidelines, § 15308 which exempts actions taken by regulatory agencies for the
enhancement and protection of the environment. As such, the Ordinance is categorically
exempt from CEQA, and none of the circumstances set forth in CEQA Guidelines Section
15300.2 applies.

SECTION 34. The City Clerk is hereby directed to file a copy of this Ordinance with the
California Building Standards Commission of the State of California.

SECTION 35. CONSTITUTIONALITY. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or
phrase of this code is for any reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional, such decision shall
not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this code.

SECTION 36. PUBLICATION. This ordinance shall be published as provided in
Government Code section 36933.

SECTION 37. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall be effective upon the
commencement of the thirty-first day following the adoption date.

The foregoing ordinance was duly and propetly introduced at a regular meeting of the City
Council of the City of Los Altos held on , 2022 and was thereafter, at a regular
meeting held on , 2022 passed and adopted by the following vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

Anita Enander, MAYOR
Attest:

Angel Rodrigues, Interim CITY CLERK

Ordinance No. 2022- 61

ATTACHMENT 1

115






